
 

City of Emporia 

  Bid Tabulation 
 

 

Service:   Petroleum Products 
 

Bid Opening: 6.21.2023 @ 2PM 

Opened By:    Lori Jarratt 
 
Witness: Matthew Culbreath  
 

 
 

Parker Oil Co.  
Rcvd: 6.21.2023 @ 10:30AM 

dwebb@parkeroilcompany.com 

 

 

Cornerstone Market  
Rcvd: 06.21.2023 @ 1;40PM 

slateandspivey@gmail.com 

 

 

AmeriGas 
Rcvd: 6.09.2023 @ 11:30AM 

dean.daconti@amerigas.com 

 

 

Pugh Lubricants 
Rcvd: 6.21.2023 @ 8:12AM 

brobinson@pughlubricants.com 

 

 

 

 

Sadler Bros. Oil Co.  
Rcvd: 6.20.2023 @ 8:40AM 

bpoarch@sadlerbrosoil.com  

Product      

Gasoline/Fleet Card System     
**Fueling locations: North Main, 
Market Drive, and W. Atlantic 

87 Octane Regular Unleaded 

 

Rack price PLUS $ .08 BP Rack price PLUS $ 0.045  No Bid No Bid Shell Rack price MINUS $.0600 

89 Octane Mid-Grade 

 
Rack price PLUS $ .08 BP Rack price PLUS $ 0.045 No Bid No Bid Shell Rack price MINUS $.0600 

93 Octane Super Unleaded Rack price PLUS $ .08 BP Rack price PLUS $ 0.045 No Bid No Bid Shell Rack price MINUS $.0600 

Off-Road Diesel Fuel (Delivered) 

 

     

11,500G to WWTP, WTP, Hicksford Pumping 
Station, Police Dept., Northside Sewage Pump 
Station, City Shop and Municipal Building 

Rack price PLUS $ .085  No bid   No Bid No Bid 

 
Shell Rack price PLUS $.1500 

On-Road Diesel Fuel/Fleet Card System      

Road Use (Low Sulfur Fuel Oil) – 20,600 Gallons 

City Equipment  
Rack price PLUS $ .08 BP Rack price PLUS $0.045 No Bid No Bid 

No Bid 

L.P. Gas      

13,520 Gallons (Estimate) 

Municipal Bldg. (2) 1,000 G Tanks, Library, (1) 1,000 G 
Tank, Animal Shelter (1-500 G Tank), City Shop, (1) 
1,000 G. Tank and WTP  

 

 

Rack price PLUS $ .280 
Or fixed price of $1.2720 

No Bid 
Area Index PLUS $1.40 
 
Delivery Fee 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Motor Oil (Bulk)      

SAE 5W20 Synthetic Blend Motor Oil - 200 Gallons 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 20.55 No Bid 

Premium Antiwear Hydraulic Oil - 600 Gallons 
 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 20.73 No Bid 

15W40 Synthetic Blend for Diesel Engines - 500 Gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23.12 No Bid 


