
 

City of Emporia 
Bid Tabulation 

 

 
 

Service:  Bulk Chemical  
WTP and WWTP 

Bid Opening:  7-10-2019 @ 2PM 
 
Opened By: Tom Delbridge 

 
Witness: Mike Allen         
 

 
 

Brenntag 
 Rcvd: 7-3-19/1:38 PM 

 
 
 
 

CONTACT: John East  
PHONE:  540-586-6380 
EMAIL:  
sebedford@brenntag.com 
 

  

Suffolk Sales & Service Corp.  
 Rcvd: 7-8-19/11:37 AM 

 
 

 
 
CONTACT: K Moran 
PHONE: 757-238-8740 
EMAIL: 
kara.moran@suffolksales.com 
 

 

Chemtrade Chemicals 
Rcvd: 7-9-19/11:51 AM 

 
 
 
 

CONTACT:  Ann Hopler 
PHONE: 800-441-2659 
EMAIL:  
bids@chemtradelogistics.com  
 

 

Water Guard, Inc. 
Rcvd: 7-9-19/11:51 AM 

 
 
 
 

CONTACT:  James Moyer 
PHONE: 252-237-5205 
EMAIL:  
jim@waterguardinc.com 
 

 
 
 

Univar  
Rcvd: 7-6-19/11:51AM 

 
 

 
 
CONTACT:  Victoria Meakim 
PHONE:  215-337-5403  
EMAIL:  
victoria.meakin@univarsolutions.com   
  
 
 

Chemrite 
Rcvd: 7-10-19/1:150 PM 

 
 
 

 
CONTACT:  Aaron Opp 
PHONE:  770-271-5576 
EMAIL:  
orders@chemrite.com  

 

Shannon Chemical Corp. 
 Rcvd: 7-2-19/3:55 PM 

 
 
 
 

CONTACT: Daniel C. Flynn  
PHONE:  610-363-9090 (24 hr.) 
EMAIL: 
dcflynn@channonchem.com  

 

C&S Chemicals 
 Rcvd: 7-9-19/11:51 AM 

 
 
 
 

CONTACT: Mike Chandles 
PHONE: 770-977-2669 
EMAIL: 
sales@candschemicals.com 

 
Product Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price 

Alum Liquid (200 WT) No Bid No Bid 
$140.17/WT  

(or $289.00/DT) 
No Bid $176.35/WT No Bid No Bid $187.92/WT 

Caustic Liquid (325WT) No Bid $159.08/WT No Bid $175.00/WT $149.25/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Fluoride (6.0 WT) $495.00/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid $461.00/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Chlorine Bleach (13,000G) No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.701/G $0.78/G No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Carbon (8 DT) $1,655.00/T No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,518.00/T $1,618/DT No Bid No Bid 

Dry Lime (26 DT) $545.00/T No Bid No Bid No Bid $545.00/T No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Potassium Permanganate (CAIROX) 
4,000LBS/55lb. pails 

$3.59/lb. No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.57/lb. $2.59/Lb. $2.34/lb. No Bid 

Phosphate (3,000G /300 G. Totes) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.99/G $5.45/G $9.37/G No Bid 

Membrane Facility (55 Gallon Drums) 

Citric Acid 50% Tech Grade (30) 
$0.655/lb. 

$366.80/Drum 
No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.17/G No Bid 

$7.33/G 
$403.15/Drum 

No Bid 

Sodium Bisulfite 40% Tech Grade (3) 
$0.284/lb. 

$170.40/Drum 
No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.224/lb. No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Sulfuric Acid 50% Tech Grade (3) 
$0.225/lb. 

$144.00/Drum 
No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.22/lb. No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Caustic 50% NSF 60 (6) 
$0.37/lb. 

$251.60/Drum 
No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.25/lb. No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Chlorine Bleach 16% NSF 60 (5) 
$2.53/G 

$139.15/Drum 
No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.88/G No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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