City of Emporia
Bid Tabulation

Service: Bulk Chemical
WTP and WWTP

Bid Opening: 7-1-2020 @ 2PM
Opened By: Lori Jarratt

Witness: Mike Allen

CarbPure Technologies
Revd: 7-1-2020/1:06PM

ICONTACT: Oscar Velasquez
PHONE: 720-259-5931

EMAIL: bid.desk@carbpure.com

Suffolk Sales & Service Corp.
Revd: 6-30-20/11:32AM

ICONTACT: K Moran
PHONE: 757-238-8740
EMAIL:kara.moran@suffolksales.com

Suffolk Solutions
Revd: 6-30-20/11:32AM

CONTACT: K Moran
PHONE: 757-238-8740
EMAIL:kara.moran@suffolksales.com

Chemtrade Chemicals
Revd: 6-30-20/11:32AM

CONTACT: Elizabeth Ryno
PHONE: 800-441-2659

EMAIL:bids@chemtradelogistics.com

Water Guard, Inc
Revd: 6-23-20/1:58PM

CONTACT: James Moyer
PHONE: 252-237-5205

EMAIL: jim@waterguardinc.com

Univar
Revd: 7-1-20/9:31AM

ICONTACT: Michael Crea
PHONE: 215-337-5411
EMAIL: michael.crea@univarsolutions.com

Product Price Price Price Price Price Price
Alum Liquid (200 WT) No Bid (Ofg%g%v/vgn $190.23/WT (oflﬁ;é%gz/ov/ng) No Bid $172/WT
Caustic Liquid (325WT) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $149.75/WT
Fluoride (6.0 WT) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $610.00/WT
Chlorine Bleach (13,000G) No Bid $.717 No Bid No Bid $0.72/G $0.78/G
Carbon (8 DT) $2,200/T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,596.00/T
Dry Lime (26 DT) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $529.00/T
Z%tggfsgn/gglrgf‘ggﬁinate (CAIROX) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.93/Ib.
Phosphate (3,000G /300 G. Totes) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Membrane Facility (55 Gallon Drums)
Citric Acid 50% Tech Grade (30) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.127/G
Sodium Bisulfite 40% Tech Grade (3) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2467/1b.
Sulfuric Acid 50% Tech Grade (3) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.28/1b.
Caustic 50% NSF 60 (6) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.319/1b.
Chlorine Bleach 16% NSF 60 (5) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.21/G
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City of Emporia
Bid Tabulation- Continued

Service: Bulk Chemical
WTP and WWTP

Bid Opening: 7-1-2020 @ 2PM
Opened By: Lori Jarratt

'Witness: Mike Allen

C&S Chemicals
Rcvd: : 6-30-20/11:32AM

CONTACT: Mike Chandles
PHONE: 770-977-2669
EMAIL: sales@candschemicals.com

Shannon Chemical Corp.
Revd: 6-25-20/12:32 PM

CONTACT: Daniel C. Flynn
PHONE: 610-363-9090

EMAIL: dcflynn@channonchem.com

Colonial Chemical
Revd: 6-23-20/1:58PM

CONTACT: Ty Butler
PHONE: 912-443-6564
EMAIL: tbutler@colonialchemical.com

USALCO
Revd: 6-29-20/1:44PM

CONTACT: Terry Badwak
PHONE: 410-354-0100
EMAIL: insidesales@usalco.com

Brenntag
Revd: 6-29-20/1:44PM

CONTACT: Stephanie Ubach
PHONE: 434-942-4723
EMAIL:jeast@brenntag.com and
msparrow@brenntag.com

Chemrite
Revd: 7-2-20/9:32AM
**UPS incorrectly sorted
package which caused delay

CONTACT: Aaron Opp
PHONE: 770.271.5576
EMAIL: orders@chemrite.com

Product Price Price Price Price Price Price

Alum Liquid (200 WT) $197.92/WT No Bid No Bid $209.53/WT No Bid NoBid
Caustic Liquid (325WT) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $147.80 (1;’12“\‘/;,‘;;"000“’- or No Bid

: . . . . No Bid
Fluoride (6.0 WT) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $454
Chlorine Bleach (13,000G) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Carbon (8 DT) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,380/DT $1,590/T
Dry Lime (26 DT) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $538/DT $600/T
Potassium Permanganate (CAIROX) . . $2.65/1b.
4,000LBS,/551b. pails No Bid $2.17/1b. $1.94/1b. No Bid $1.77/1b. (55.121b.)
Phosphate (3,000G /300 G. Totes) No Bid $6.47/G No Bid No Bid $5.44/Gal. $6.43/Gal.

Error in Enospnate pI'lClIlg per barry
Membrane Facility (55 Gallon Drums) 8/6/2020. Should be approx. $2 mor/
galion
Citric Acid 50% Tech Grade (30) No Bid $6.14/G $0.52/1b No Bid $335.50/Drum No Bid
$337.70/Drum ' ' '

Sodium Bisulfite 40% Tech Grade (3) No Bid No Bid $0.35/1b. No Bid $136.40/Drum No Bid
Sulfuric Acid 50% Tech Grade (3) No Bid No Bid $0.32/1b. No Bid $136.95/Drum No Bid
Caustic 50% NSF 60 (6) No Bid No Bid $0.30/1b. No Bid $171.05/Drum No Bid
Chlorine Bleach 16% NSF 60 (5) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $102.85/Drum No Bid
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