City of Emporia

Bid Tabulation
Service: Bulk Chemical
i i Catalynt Solutions, Citco Water Water Guard, Inc | Univar Solutions | C&S Chemicals [Shannon ChemicalSuperb Solutions Brenntag Chemrite Carbon Chemtrade
Bid Opening: 6.25.2024 @ Inc. Revd: 6.25.2024 @ | Revd: 6.21.2024 | Revd: 06.21.2024 | Rcvd: 6.20.2024 Corp. For You, Inc. | Rcvd: 6.21.2024 @ |Rcvd: 6.24.2024 @ | Activated Corp |Rcvd: 6.21.2024
2PM Rcvd: 6.25.2024 @ 9:51AM @ 10:07AM @ 12 :30PM @11:44AM | Rcvd: 6.20.2024 @| Rcvd: 6.21.2024 12:30PM 11:21AM Revd: 6.24.2024) @ 12:30PM
Opened By: Lori R. Jarratt 12 :32PM 1:26PM @ 11:25AM @ 11:21AM
Matthew Culbreath
Product Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
A. Liquid Alum 200 WT $268/WT No Bid No Bid $227.48/WT | $224.00/WT No Bid $139.10/WT No Bid No Bid NoBid |$142.59/WT
B. Caustic Soda (325WT) No Bid No Bid $265.00/WT | $196.00/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid $168.00/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid
C. Fluoride (6.0WT) No Bid No Bid No Bid $725.00/WT No Bid $1,444.77/WT No Bid $839.730/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid
F. Hydrated Lime (26 DT) No Bid No Bid No Bid $943.19/DT No Bid No Bid No Bid $807.55/DT No Bid No Bid No Bid
G Eg:’l‘;%‘)‘(r)" permanganate | (4000.8%/55Ib. | No Big $5.235/LBS No Bid $266/LBS | NoBid | $317/LBS | NoBid $324/LBS | $236/LBS | NoBid No Bid
H. Corrosion Inhibitor e No Bid $18.368/G No Bid $9.81/G No Bid $10.67/G No Bid $11.025/G | $12.06/G No Bid No Bid
I.  Liquid Ammonium Sulfate  |(3600G/300G. totes) No Bid $5.046/G $4.68/G $4.13/G No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Membrane Facility (55 Gallon Drums)
B. Caustic Soda (6-55G Drums) No Bid $279.00/Drum No Bid $253.56/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid $234.100/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
D. Sodium Hypochlorite (5-55G Drums) No Bid $315.00/Drum No Bid $226.92/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid $183.25/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
U. Sodium Bisulfite (3-55G Drums) No Bid $211.71/Drum No Bid $223.20/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid $259.99/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
K. Citric Acid (30-55G Drums) No Bid $1,062.50/Drum No Bid $559.35/Drum No Bid $685.85/Drum No Bid $615.00/Drum |$618.68/Drum| No Bid No Bid
L. Sulfuric Acid (3-55G Drums) No Bid $197.14/Drum No Bid $315.15/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid $223.80/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid

THE RESULTS RECEIVED IN RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICITATION DO NOT REFLECT AWARD OF THIS
CONTRACT. RESPONSES WILL BE FURTHER EVALUATED BY THE CITY OF EMPORIA.






