Bid Tabulation

Items Packaging Offe.ror's Brand
Price
Facial Tissue
Brame 100/BX-30/CS $64.25/CS AngelSoft
Central Poly 100/BX-30/CS $23.00/CS Central Poly
Pyramid School Products 100/BX-30/CS $34.98/CS Boardwalk
Furniture Polish
Brame 12-170z. Cans /CS | $37.43/CS Aero Lemon
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 12-200z. Cans/CS | $39.98/CS Chase

Handwipe Towels

Brame 200/BX-8BX/CS [$127.93/CS Taskbrand Wiper - Pull Grab
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 200/Box 35.99/BX Wypall
Latex Gloves
Brame 10x10/CS 46.10/CS Ammex
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 100/BX-10BX/CS | 34.98/CS Hospeco
Multi Fold Towels
Brame 4,000/CS $27.15/CS Marcal
Central Poly 250/PK-16PKS/CS | $24.00/CS Central Poly
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Regular Rolls of Paper Towels
Brame 30RL/CS $58.30/CS 70SHT/RL  |Sparkle
Central Poly 30RL/CS $25.00/CS 85SH/Roll  |Resolute
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Tork Paper Towels
Brame 6Rolls/CS $73.80/CS Tork for H1 Dispensers
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
All-purpose Spray Cleaner
Brame 12-Quart Bottles/CS| $45.70/CS Clean by Peroxy
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
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Antibacterial Floral Foam Hand Soap

1000ML Refills for

Brame $68.85/CS| NoTouch"D" |Kutol
Dispenser
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Can Liners 24x33
Brame 25/20/CS Rolls $41.05/CS 1MIL Poly Plastics
Central Poly 500/CS $19.00 1MIL Central Poly
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Can Liners 33x39
Brame 100/CS $17.90/CS Poly Plastics
Central Poly 250 $18.50/CS Central Poly
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Can Liners 38x60
Brame 100/CS $27.65/CS Aluf
Central Poly 100 $20.50 Central Poly
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Compact Toilet Tissue
Brame 36RL/CS $88.85/CS GP
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Desktop Hand Sanitizer - 100z. Bottles
Brame 120Z- 12/CS $68.25/CS Purell
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 1707 $3.99/ea Dermagel
Disinfectant Spray
Brame 12QT/CS $47.95/CS Spartan
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 12/16.50Z Cans | $38.99/CS Chase
Disinfectant Wipes
Brame 125/CAN-6CAN/CS | $67.65/CS Spartan
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 35/TUB 12TUBS/CS | $45.99/CS Lysol
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Glass Cleaner
Brame 12-320z. Bottles/CS| $39.45/CS Spartan
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 12-200Z Cans/CS | $37.99/CS Chase
Instant Hand Sanitizer 1.2L
Brame 1200ML/2/CS $93.56/CS [G0JO Use Dispenser|Purell
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Kitchen Trash Bags 13G
Brame 200/CS $24.60/CS Aluf
Central Poly 90 $16.99/CS Central Poly
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Moisturizing Foaming Hand Soap 1150ML
Brame No Bid No Bid N/A
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Neutral Disinfectant Cleaner - 1G Jugs
Brame 4/CS $52.60/CS Spartan
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Sensor Upright Vacuum Cleaner
Brame Each $416.65/EA Bissell
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A
Swiffer Duster Refills
Brame 10PK 4PK/CS $41.35/CS Swiffer
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 6/BX 4BX/CS $42.99/CS Swiffer

Toilet Seat Covers

Brame 20PKS/250 5000/CS| $47.85/CS Health Guard
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 250/BX 20BX/CS | $37.85/CS Hospeco
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Urinal Mats
Brame 6/CS $83.65/CS Scented UriGard
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 6EA/CS $41.94/CS Impact
Urinal Screens
Brame 10/BX $22.82/BX Fresh
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 6/12/CS $65.94/CS Hospeco
Wasp and Hornet Spray
Brame 200Z 12/CS $64.44/CS Spartan
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products 200Z12/CS $59.98/CS Chase
Windsor Sensor & Versamatic Vacuum Bags
Brame 5PK 10PKG/CS $4.90/PK Bissell
Central Poly No Bid No Bid N/A
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid N/A




