
City of Emporia
Bid Tabulation

THE RESULTS RECEIVED IN RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICITATION DO NOT REFLECT AWARD OF THIS
CONTRACT. RESPONSES WILL BE FURTHER EVALUATED BY THE CITY OF EMPORIA.

Service: Bulk Chemical

Bid Opening:  6.23.2025 @ 2PM
CITCO

Rcvd: eVA 6.23.25 @
12:45PM

Water Guard, Inc
Rcvd: 06.20.2025 @

1:20PM

Univar Solutions
Rcvd: 06.20.2025

@ 10 :57AM

C&S Chemicals
Rcvd: eVA 6.20.25
@12:25PM

Shannon Chemical
Corp.

 Rcvd: eVA 6.12.25
@ 3:40PM

Superb Solutions 
For You, Inc.

Rcvd: eVA
6.23.2025 @

12:27PM

Brenntag
Rcvd:  eVA

6.23.2025 @ 
11:04AM

Chemrite
Rcvd: eVA 6.23.25 @

11:25AM

Carbon Activated
Corp

Rcvd: 6.23.25 @
10:31AM

Chemtrade
Rcvd: eVA

06.19.2025 @
8:23AM

Product Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

A. Liquid Alum 200 WT $240.00/WT No Bid $229.84/WT $244.00/WT No Bid $159.00/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid $117.86/WT

B. Caustic Soda (325WT) $668.00/WT  $265.00/WT $191.15/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid $163.80/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid

C. Fluoride (6.0 WT) $862.00/WT No Bid $780.00/WT No Bid $1,717.34/WT No Bid $754.00/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid

D. Sodium Hypochlorite (13,000G) $3.698/G $1.99/G $1.85/G No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.0950/G No Bid No Bid No Bid

E. Powdered Activated Carbon (8 DT) $2,500/DT No Bid $2,200/DT No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,498.00/DT $2,380.00/DT $2,620/DT No Bid

F. Hydrated Lime (26 DT) No Bid No Bid $720.00/DT No Bid No Bid No Bid $878.00/DT No Bid No Bid No Bid

G. Potassium Permanganate 
(CAIROX) 

(4,000LBS/55lb.
Pails) $4.95/LBS No Bid $2.31/LBS No Bid $2.44/LBS No Bid No Bid $2.46/LBS No Bid No Bid

H. Corrosion Inhibitor
(3,500G/300 G.

Totes) $10.42/G No Bid $9.24/G No Bid $10.27/G No Bid No Bid $10.89/G No Bid No Bid

I. Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (3,600G/300G. totes) $3.50/G $4.00/G $2.83/G No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Membrane Facility (55 Gallon Drums)

B. Caustic Soda (6-55G Drums) $234.00/Drum No Bid $238.00/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid $194.20/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid

D. Sodium Hypochlorite (5-55G Drums) $196.00/Drum No Bid $197.00/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid $186.00/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid

J. Sodium Bisulfite (3-55G Drums) $211.710/Drum No Bid $205.00/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.00/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid

K. Citric Acid (30-55G Drums) $1,062.00/Drum No Bid $551.65/Drum No Bid $554.54/Drum No Bid $469.00/Drum $520.74/Drum No Bid No Bid

L. Sulfuric Acid (3-55G Drums) $197.14/Drum No Bid $292.11/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid $155.00/Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid




